
22-27 November 2021 
Monday 22nd   Tuesday 23rd   Wednesday 24th  Thursday 25th  Friday 26th  Saturday 27th  

Leid Week 2021 launch Series of School 
Workshops 
 
Causeway Coast & Glens 
(Matthew Warwick) 
 

Bards by the Bann 

 
Time: 1:00pm 
Venue: Riverside Theatre 
(also online) 
 
For details and booking 
visit here. 
 
 

Series of School 
Workshops 
 
Causeway Coast & Glens 
(Stuart Paterson) 
 
Monaghan (Matthew 
Warwick) 
 
Donegal - (Matthew 
Warwick) 
 
 

Libraries NI - Rhymes 
frae Rathfriland 
 
Local Ulster-Scots poet 
Roy Ferguson will share 
some poems from his 
forthcoming book of the 
same name. 
 
Please book directly with 
the library. 
 
Time: 11:00  
Venue: Banbridge Library  
 

Ulster-Scots Language for 
Weans 
 
Time: 10:30am-12:30pm 
Venue: Hill of the O’Neill 
& Ranfurly House Arts 
Centre 
 
For details and booking 
visit here. 
 

The Language of Hame 
 
Gary and Anne Blair 
introduce the history, 
heritage and language of 
Ulster-Scots in the 
Borough focusing on 
local poets, authors, and 
its influence on place 
names in the local area.  
 
Time: 2:30-3:30pm 
Venue: Portrush Town 
Hall  
 
Tickets are free but pre-
booking is essential. For 
details and booking visit 
here. 
 

Ulster Scots Leid Event 
 
Paula McIntyre provides a 

traditional cookery 

demonstration. This is 

complemented by a 

presentation on Ulster-

Scots cultural heritage, 

music and language. 

 

Time: 11:00-12:30pm 
Venue: Arthur Cottage 
 
** SOLD OUT **  
 
 

Ulster-Scots Walking 
Tour – Antrim Town 
 
Time: 10:00-11:30am 
Venue: Commences at 
The Old Courthouse 
Theatre, Antrim 
 
Registration is essential. 
For details and booking 
visit here. 
 
 
 

Ulster-Scots Walking 
Tour – Newtownabbey 
 
Time: 10:00-11:30am 
Venue: Commences at 
The Whitehouse, 
Newtownabbey 
 
Registration is essential. 
For details and booking 
visit here.  
 
 

Ulster-Scots Walking 
Tour – Ballyclare 
 
Time: 10:00-11:30am  
Venue: Commences at 
Ballyclare Town Hall 
 
Registration is essential. 
For details and booking 
visit here. 
 
 

Creative Writing 
Workshop with Stuart 
Paterson 
 
The theme of this session 
is FUTURE TENSE. That is, 
Scots / Ulster-Scots as a 
language of the now, of 
evolution of all its 
speakers of all ages & its 
words & relation to the 
modern world. 
 
Time: 12:00-16:00 
Venue: Discover Ulster-
Scots Centre, Belfast 
 
For details and booking 
visit here. 

https://www.riversidetheatre.org.uk/whats-on/bards-by-the-bann,-a-celebration-of-poetry-for-leid-week
https://dungannon.ticketsolve.com/shows/873628758/events/129384469
https://freeulsterscotstalkportrush2021.eventbrite.co.uk/
https://theatreatthemill.ticketsolve.com/shows/873629030
https://theatreatthemill.ticketsolve.com/shows/873629031
https://theatreatthemill.ticketsolve.com/shows/873629034
https://www.eventbrite.co.uk/e/creative-writing-workshop-with-stuart-paterson-tickets-209959974937


Launch of Ulster-Scots 
Animated Story & 
Videos 
 
Time: 16:15  
Venue: Reivers House, 
Kilkeel 
 
 
Also streaming live via 
Schomberg Mourne 
Ulster-Scots Facebook 
page. 
 

‘The Storyteller’ book 
launch 
 
Time: 12:30-2:30pm 
(refreshments from noon) 
Venue: Londonderry 
Room, Ards Arts Centre 
 
Event is free to attend, 
but registration is 
essential. Visit here for 
more details. 
 
 
 

The Language of Hame 
 
Gary and Anne Blair will 
introduce the history, 
heritage and language of 
Ulster-Scots in the 
Borough focusing on 
local poets, authors, and 
its influence on place 
names in the local area. 
 
Time: 2:30-3:30pm 
Venue: Roe Valley Arts 
and Cultural Centre, 
Limavady 
 
Tickets are free but pre-
booking is essential. For 
details and booking visit 
here. 
 
 

Libraries NI - Robert 
Campbell  
 
This informal session will 
see Robert recite some of 
his poetry as well as 
excerpts from his latest 
book “Tales frae the life o 
James Finlay Bruce”. 
 
Time: 12:30-1:30pm 
Venue: Omagh Library 
 
Please book directly with 
the library. 
 
 

Ulster-Scots Writing 
Competition - winners 
announcement 
 
The winners of this 
inaugural competition 
will be announced ahead 
of winning entries being 
published by the Linen 
Hall Library. 
 
Time: 1pm 
Venue: Linen Hall 
Library’s Performance 
Area 
 

 

History into Poetry, The 
Works of James 
McKowen, the Bard of 
Lambeg 
 
Book launch (invitation 
only) 
 
Time: 19:00 
Venue: Irish Linen 
Centre & Lisburn 
Museum 
 
Accompanying 
exhibition open  
Mon-Sat: 09.30-16.00 
until further notice. 
 

Libraries NI - Rhymes & 
Ructions, Ballads & 
Banter from Ballyclare 
 
Local author Jack 
McKinney will share some 
verse & wee stories from 
his forthcoming book of 
the same name. 
 
Time: 6:30pm 
Venue: Ballyclare Library  
 
Booking is essential. Call 
028 9335 2269 or email 
ballyclare.library@librarie
sni.org.uk to register. 
 
 
 
 

Schools Workshop  
 
Cambridge House 
Grammar School 
Ballymena  
 
(Matthew Warwick) 

Libraries NI - Anne 
McMaster 
 
This informal talk will 
take a look at how Ulster-
Scots words populate our 
everyday language, and 
how richly and musically 
they work in poetry - 
both as a means of 
remembering past times 
and commenting on our 
lives today.   
 
Time: 6:00-7:00pm 
Venue: Larne Library 
 
Please book directly with 
the library. 
 
 

Buttermilk Loney 
 
A session of Ulster-Scots 
influenced music  
 
Time: 1:00-2:00pm 
Venue: Witch’s Hat 
bandstand, Portstewart 
 
  
 
 

 

http://tinyurl.com/WGLyttleBiog
https://www.eventbrite.co.uk/e/the-language-of-hame-limavady-tickets-206257049387
mailto:ballyclare.library@librariesni.org.uk
mailto:ballyclare.library@librariesni.org.uk


Ulster Scots Street 
Names Exhibition 
 
Mon-Sat: 09:00 – 17:00 
Venue: Arts for All 
 
Unit C, Cityside Mall, 
100-150 York Road, BT15 
1WA (accessed at Burger 
King entrance) 

Libraries NI - Rhymes frae 
Rathfriland 
 
Local Ulster-Scots poet 
Roy Ferguson will share 
some poems from his 
forthcoming book of the 
same name. 
 
Please book directly with 
the library. 
 
Time: 6:30pm  
Venue: Dromore Library  
 

A Night of Ulster-Scots 
 
A night of Ulster-Scots 

poetry, songs, 

conversation and 

refreshments. 

 
Time: 7:00pm 
Venue: Monreagh 
Community Hall  
 
Pre-booking is essential. 
Visit here for more 
details. 
 
 

The leevin tongue  
 
Gary Blair explores the 
Ulster-Scots language 
 
Time: 7:30pm 
Venue: Randalstown 
Orange Hall 

An evening of Ulster-
Scots poetry and song  
 
In the first event of this 
type organised by 
Kirknarra School of 
Dance the evening aims 
to highlight the everyday 
use of the Ulster-Scots 
language through local 
poetry and song. 
 
Time: 7:30pm 
Venue: Tommy’s 
Cottage, Hanna’s Close, 
Kilkeel.  
 
To book a place, please 
contact Kirknarra School 
of Dance on 
07753222553. 
 
Also streaming live via 
Schomberg Mourne 
Ulster-Scots Facebook 
page. 
 

 

 The leevin tongue  
 
Gary Blair explores the 
Ulster-Scots language 
 
Time: 7:30pm 
Venue: Coleraine Ulster 
Scots Centre 
 

The leevin tongue  
 
Gary Blair explores the 
Ulster-Scots language 
 
Time: 7:30pm 
Venue: Broughshane 
Orange Hall 
 

   

 

  

https://www.eventbrite.com/e/a-night-of-ulster-scots-tickets-205744456207?aff=ebdssbdestsearch&keep_tld=1


DIGITAL CONTENT: 
VIDEO / APP 
 
'Parin the Scra' - At the 
Foot of Knocklayde   
https://youtu.be/diwO2J
N6bbQ 
 

DIGITAL CONTENT: VIDEO 
/ APP 
 
'Ganshes and Good Yins' - 
At the Foot of Knocklayde  
https://youtu.be/TQ1Tvm
0s-o0 
 

DIGITAL CONTENT: 
VIDEO / APP 
 
'The Stiffy Lifters' - At the 
Foot of Knocklayde  
https://youtu.be/0AiBnI
Hmv8M 
 
 

DIGITAL CONTENT: 
VIDEO / APP 
 
'Ye Wundnae Be Here' - 
At the Foot of Knocklayde  
https://youtu.be/jrP9Z8u
4_gU 
 

DIGITAL CONTENT: 
VIDEO / APP 
 
'Naw Yin Hallion' - At the 
Foot of Knocklayde  
https://youtu.be/3l2cXQ
e0U3c 
 

DIGITAL CONTENT: VIDEO 
/ APP 
 
'Sookin Straight Frae The 
Worm' - At the Foot of 
Knocklayde  
https://youtu.be/GulZ5_7
vhk0 
 

DIGITAL CONTENT:  
‘My Meentith An’ Me’ 
by Alan Millar 
 
Time: 11:00am 
Venue: Online 
www.derrystrabane.com
/ulsterscots 
 
In this short film, Alan 
Millar presents his own 
poem ‘My Meentith an’ 
me’, which explores the 
Donegal-Tyrone Ulster-
Scots literary heritage of 
William Starrat. 
 
 

DIGITAL CONTENT:  
‘The Gruffalo’s Wean’ and 
‘Scotch the Scare-Go' by 
Bready and District 
Ulster-Scots Development 
Association & Darren 
Gibson  
 
Time: 11:00am 
Venue: Online 
www.derrystrabane.com/
ulsterscots 
 
This short storytelling 
feature presents two 
magical short stories for 
children: ‘The Gruffalo’s 
Wean’ and ‘Scotch the 
Scare-Go'.  
 
 

DIGITAL CONTENT:  
‘The Return O John 
Munn’ by Liam Logan 
 
Time: 11:00am 
Venue: Online 
www.derrystrabane.com
/ulsterscots 
 
Author, journalist and 
broadcaster Liam Logan 
presents ‘The Return O 
John Munn’ - an 
engaging original poem 
delivered in a light-
hearted and entertaining 
style. 
 
 
 

DIGITAL CONTENT:  
‘Sabbath Dander’ by 
Robert Campbell 
 
Time: 11:00am 
Venue: Online 
www.derrystrabane.com/
ulsterscots 
 
Ulster-Scots writer 
Robert Campbell reflects 
on the natural and social 
history of Brooke Park, a 
familiar and well-loved 
landmark in the Derry 
City and Strabane District 
Council area.   
 
 

DIGITAL CONTENT:  
‘The Words That Carry 
Us Home’ by Anne 
McMaster 
 
Time: 11:00am 
Venue: Online 
www.derrystrabane.com
/ulsterscots 
 
In this short film, poet 
and playwright Anne 
McMaster collaborates 
with a composer from 
Derry to set a number of 
her original Ulster-Scots 
poems to music.   
 
 
 

 
 

DIGITAL CONTENT:  
‘Ain tha Foyle’ by 
Robert Campbell 
 
Time: 2:00pm 
Venue: Online 
www.derrystrabane.com
/ulsterscots 
 
In this short film, Ulster-
Scots poet Robert 
Campbell tells the story 
of the River Foyle down 
through time, exploring 

DIGITAL CONTENT:  
‘1718 - Wonders and 
Wurds’ by Andrew Tinney 
 
Time: 2:00pm 
Venue: Online 
www.derrystrabane.com/
ulsterscots 
 

This short educational film 

explores the relevance of 

the 1718 migration to the 

Ulster-Scots people, 

DIGITAL CONTENT:  
‘The Way Ye Speak’ by 
Stuart Paterson 
 
Time: 2:00pm 
Venue: Online 
www.derrystrabane.com
/ulsterscots 
 
Stuart Paterson, former 
BBC Scotland Poet in 
Residence and national 
Scots Language Awards 
‘Writer of the Year’ 2020, 

DIGITAL CONTENT:  
‘McBane’s Skull’ by Steve 

Dornan 

 
Time: 2:00pm 
Venue: Online 
www.derrystrabane.com/
ulsterscots 
 
Ulster-Scots poet Steve 
Dornan presents 
‘McBane’s Skull’, a 
supernatural tale about a 

This Oul Fermin Life 
A Poem by Charlie Gillen 
 
https://youtu.be/7SyCLC
K-_Qo 
 

 

https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_diwO2JN6bbQ&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=pnybVY8jXGWRIIpGuVG1tq0j9XGEQVFZZ1Kymdzj1TQ&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_diwO2JN6bbQ&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=pnybVY8jXGWRIIpGuVG1tq0j9XGEQVFZZ1Kymdzj1TQ&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_TQ1Tvm0s-2Do0&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=8HRz19tXmwmjnMoRonVkC1hu2z41fhUWQ-LOEcSybYw&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_TQ1Tvm0s-2Do0&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=8HRz19tXmwmjnMoRonVkC1hu2z41fhUWQ-LOEcSybYw&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_0AiBnIHmv8M&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=3mHiKDrAz0IGcCbZDDlp4SMROWAmA2cePCx8UfOEkNk&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_0AiBnIHmv8M&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=3mHiKDrAz0IGcCbZDDlp4SMROWAmA2cePCx8UfOEkNk&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_jrP9Z8u4-5FgU&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=DNKdJbYiHDHyjWLkYAGFgtBjMx7VwQVaR5U8ruCiV1I&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_jrP9Z8u4-5FgU&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=DNKdJbYiHDHyjWLkYAGFgtBjMx7VwQVaR5U8ruCiV1I&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_3l2cXQe0U3c&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=cmwzGj6MknGlfs0P2Bom0mA5gSLHq_y8am_TggVOz_k&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_3l2cXQe0U3c&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=cmwzGj6MknGlfs0P2Bom0mA5gSLHq_y8am_TggVOz_k&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_GulZ5-5F7vhk0&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=nx0tA9NxmyE1yYQPlSeKOPtB49ko8zCSz3zKxzMPaJo&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_GulZ5-5F7vhk0&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=nx0tA9NxmyE1yYQPlSeKOPtB49ko8zCSz3zKxzMPaJo&e=
http://www.derrystrabane.com/ulsterscots)
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https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_7SyCLCK-2D-5FQo&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=z_-mcoab630kYhlz99SC0OcD3Zq2AP5-6mxfWZ0fSRc&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__youtu.be_7SyCLCK-2D-5FQo&d=DwMF-g&c=euGZstcaTDllvimEN8b7jXrwqOf-v5A_CdpgnVfiiMM&r=xNUeMJ-1WRp_SygMK-xGcxnIbtmnnjSbet8xkxTjNB0&m=LFGWQ5pvj32aCql-f-PAnLmnjYVautaFL3ZYpvMnSCM&s=z_-mcoab630kYhlz99SC0OcD3Zq2AP5-6mxfWZ0fSRc&e=


the global significance of 
the river to local and 
world history.  
 
 

illustrating the life they 

left behind and what lay in 

store for them on the 

shores of America.  

 
 

challenges the 
misconception that 
Ulster-Scots is just a 
traditional language. 
 
 

girl who is cursed by a 
carved stone skull in a 
local kirkyard. This short 
film also includes some 
additional explanations 
around Ulster-Scots 
vocabulary and content. 
 

 

 


